
(1699) 

 
Haryana Government Gazette 

EXTRAORDINARY 

Published by Authority 
© Govt.  of   Haryana  

No. 119–2020/Ext.]  CHANDIGARH,  MONDAY,  AUGUST  24,  2020  (BHADRA  2, 1942  SAKA) 

HARYANA VIDHAN SABHA SECRETARIAT 

Notification 

The 24th August, 2020 

No. 21-HLA of 2020/65/11504.—  The Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and 

Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Amendment Bill, 2020, is hereby 

published for general information under proviso to Rule 128 of  the Rules of Procedure and 

Conduct of Business in the Haryana Legislative Assembly :– 

Bill No. 21–HLA of 2020                                                     

THE HARYANA MANAGEMENT OF CIVIC AMENITIES AND INFRASTRUCTURE 

DEFICIENT MUNICIPAL AREAS (SPECIAL PROVISIONS) AMENDMENT  

BILL, 2020 

A 

BILL 

 further to amend the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure 

Deficient Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016.  

 Be it enacted by the Legislature of the State of Haryana in the Seventy-first Year of the 

Republic of India as follows :– 

 

1. (1) This Act may be called the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and 

Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Amendment Act, 2020. 

 (2) It shall be deemed to have come into force with effect from the 21st April, 2016. 

Short title and 

commencement. 

2. In section 4 of the Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient 

Municipal Areas (Special Provisions) Act, 2016,- 

(i) in sub-section (1), for the words “three years”, the words “five years” shall be 

substituted; and 

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the words “three years”, the words “five years” shall be 

substituted. 

Amendment of 
section 4 of 

Haryana Act 14 of 
2016.  



1700 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.),  AUG.  24,  2020  (BHDR. 2, 1942  SAKA) 

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS 

1. The Haryana Management of Civic Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas (Special 

Provision) Act 2016 was enacted to identify those areas falling within Municipal Limits where construction 

has taken place on more than fifty percent plots prior to 31st March 2015 to declare such areas as the Civic 

Amenities and Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas to provide Civic Amenities and Infrastructure in such 

Areas. In this Act under section 4 “Enforcement to be kept in Abeyance” was for a period of one year which 

was upto 20.04.2017. The department took following action within the validity period of one year.  

a. Issued guidelines to seek proposal from municipalities vide letter dated 10.7.2015  

b. Circulated the procedure vide memo dated 16.09.2016, 18.11.2016 and 26.12.2016 (which were kept on 

hold vide memo dated 08.08.2017). 

c. Issued Development Charges vide order dated 04.10.2016. (which were kept on hold vide memo dated 

21.10.2016). 

2. Since, action regarding declaration of unauthorized colonies could not be completed within one year, therefore 

further  an amendment in the Act was brought extending the time limits from “one year” to “two years” vide 

notification  dated 23.11.2017.the said Act was valid till 20.04.2018. 

a. Thereafter proposals received from various municipalities were examined. Out of the proposal of total 

982 colonies of 80 municipalities, 528 colonies were found eligible. 

b. 15 colonies of MC, Gurugram and 9 colonies of MC Faridabad were notified vide notification dated 

06.12.2017 under the Act.  

3. In the meanwhile action regarding declaration of unauthorized colonies could not be completed within two 

years, therefore another amendment in the Act was brought extending the time limits from “two year” to “three 

years” vide notification dated 19.04.2018. As per the said amendment, the Act is valid till 20.04.2019:-  

a. Thereafter 17 colonies of Municipal corporation Gurugram and Faridabad, 343 colonies of other 

Municipal Corporations, 106 colonies of Municipal Councils and 181 colonies of Municipal 

Committees  have been notified till date 

b. Development Charges have been issued vide order dated 27.09.2018. 

4. The amendment to extend validity of the said Act for four years i.e. from 21.04.2016 to 20.04.2020, was 

submitted by the Department to the Government and the same was also got approved by Vidhan Sabha, but the 

same could not get notified.  

5. During the period of 21.04.2019 to 20.04.2020, the Department notified 15 colonies vide notifications dated 

18.06.2019, 10.09.2019, 17.01.2020 and also issued various instructions. Since, the amendment could not get 

notified, therefore it is required to extend the validity of the Act. 

6. Further, at present there are about 15 of colonies for which revised proposal from MCs have been received, 

which are yet to be notified under the said Act, for which the validity of the said Act is required to be 

extended. 

7. All actions pertaining to declaration of colonies is to be completed within the validity period, but considering 

that some colonies are yet to be notified which is likely to take time more than the valid period specified in the 

Act,hence, it is required to extend the period stated in the section 4 of the Act for completion of the process. It 

is, therefore, proposed that in section 4 (1) and (2) of the Act the words “three years” may be substituted by the 

words “five years” so that two more years may be made available to declare areas as the Civic Amenities and 

Infrastructure Deficient Municipal Areas. 

         

ANIL VIJ, 

Urban Local Bodies Minister, Haryana. 

________ 

Chandigarh: R. K. NANDAL, 

The 24th August, 2020. Secretary. 



 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.),  AUG.  24,  2020  (BHDR. 2, 1942  SAKA) 1701 

[izkf/kd`r vuqokn] 

2020 dk fo/ks;d la[;k 21 ,p-,y-,- 

gfj;k.kk uxjikfydk {ks=ksa esa viw.kZ ukxfjd lq[k&lqfo/kkvksa rFkk  

volajpuk dk izca/ku ¼fo'ks"k micU/k½ la'kks/ku fo/ks;d] 2020 

gfj;k.kk uxjikfydk {ks=ksa esa viw.kZ ukxfjd lq[k&lqfo/kkvksa rFkk  

volajpuk dk izca/ku ¼fo'ks"k micU/k½ vf/kfu;e] 2016]   

dks vkxs la’kksf/kr djus ds fy, 

fo/ks;d 

Hkkjr x.kjkT; ds bdgRrjosa o"kZ esa gfj;k.kk jkT; fo/kkue.My }kjk fuEufyf[kr :i esa ;g vf/kfu;fer 

gks %& 

1- ¼1½ ;g vf/kfu;e gfj;k.kk uxjikfydk {ks=ksa esa viw.kZ ukxfjd lq[k&lqfo/kkvksa rFkk 

volajpuk dk izca/ku ¼fo'ks"k micU/k½ la’kks/ku vf/kfu;e] 2020] dgk tk ldrk gSA 

 ¼2½ ;g 21 vizSy] 2016 ls ykxw gqvk le>k tk,xkA 

Lkaf{kIr uke rFkk 

izkjEHkA 

2- gfj;k.kk uxjikfydk {ks=ksa esa viw.kZ ukxfjd lq[k&lqfo/kkvksa rFkk volajpuk dk izca/ku  

¼fo'ks"k micU/k½ vf/kfu;e] 2016 dh /kkjk 4 esa]& 

¼i½ mi&/kkjk ¼1½ esa] **rhu o"kZ** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij] **ik¡p Ok"kZ** 'kCn izfrLFkkfir fd,  

tk,axs ( rFkk 

¼ii½ mi&/kkjk ¼2½ esa] **rhu o"kZ** 'kCnksa ds LFkku ij] **ik¡p Ok"kZ** 'kCn izfrLFkkfir fd, 

tk,axsA 

2016 ds gfj;k.kk 

vf/kfu;e 14 dh 

/kkjk 4 dk 

la'kks/kuA                 

 

 



1702 HARYANA GOVT. GAZ. (EXTRA.),  AUG.  24,  2020  (BHDR. 2, 1942  SAKA) 

mn~ns';ksa ,oa dkj.kksa dk fooj.k 

1- gfj;k.kk uxjikfydk viw.kZ {ks=ksa esa ukxfjd lq[k&lqfo/kkvksa rFkk volajpuk dk izcU/ku ¼fo’ks"k micU/k½ vf/kfu;e 

2016 ikfydk lhekvksa esa iM+us okys mu {ks=ksa dks igpkuus ds fy;s vf/kfu;fer fd;k x;k Fkk tgk¡ 31-3-2015 ls 

iwoZ 50 izfr’kr IykVksa ij fuekZ.k fd;k tk pqdk gS dks ukxfjd lq[k&lqfo/kkvksa rFkk volajpuk iznku djus ds fy;s 

bu {ks=ksa dk ukxfjd lq[k&lqfo/kkvksa rFkk volajpuk viw.kZ uxjikfydk {ks= ?kksf"kr fd;k tkuk gSA bl vf/kfu;e 

dh /kkjk 4 ^izorZu vLFkfxr j[kuk^ ,d o"kZ dh vof/k ds fy, Fkh] tks 20-04-2017 rd FkhA bl foHkkx }kjk ,d 

lky dh oS/krk ds vUrjky esa fuEufyf[kr dk;Z fd;s x;s % 

d- Ukxjikfydkvksa ls izLrko izkIr djus ds fy, i= fnukad 10-7-2015 }kjk fn’kk&funsZ’k tkjh fd, x,A 

[k-  bl izfØ;k dks Kkiu fnukad 16-09-2016]18-11-2016 rFkk 26-12-2016 }kjk ifjpkfyr fd;k x;k ¼ftl ij 

Kkiu fnukad 08-08-2017 }kjk jksd yxk nh xbZ½A 

x- vkns’k fnukad 04-10-2016 }kjk fodkl 'kqYd tkjh fd, x,] ¼ftl ij Kkiu fnukad 21-10-2016 ds }kjk 

jksd yxk nh xbZ ½A                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                               

2- pwafd vuf/kd̀r dkWyksfu;ksa dks ?kksf"kr djus dh izfØ;k ,d lky esa iw.kZ ugha gks ldh] blfy, vf/kfu;e esa ,d 

lky dh vof/k dks nks lky dk la’ksk/ku vf/klwpuk fnukad 23-11-2017 }kjk fd;k x;k FkkA mijksDr vf/kfu;e dh 

oS/krk fnukad 20-04-2018 rd FkhA 

d-   blds mijkar jkT; esa ikfydk lhekvksa ds vUrxZr ,sls ukxfjd lq[k&lqfo/kkvksa rFkk volajpuk viw.kZ 

uxjikfydk {ks=ksa ds losZ dh çfØ;k vkjEHk dj nhA dqy 982 dWkyksfu;ksa ds izLrko 80 uxjikfydkvksa ls 

izkIr gq;s gSa] ftuesa ls 528 izLrko ;ksX; ik;s x;s gSaA 

[k-  xq:xzke dh 15 dkWyksfu;ka rFkk Qjhnkckn dh 9 dkWyksfu;ksa dks bl vf/kfu;e ds vUrxZr vf/klwpuk  

fnukad 06-12-2017 }kjk vf/klwfpr fd;k x;kA 

3- bl chp] vuf/kd̀r dkWyksfu;ksa dh ?kks"k.kk ds lEcU/k esa dkjZokbZ nks o"kksZa ds vUnj iwjh ugha dh tk ldh] blfy, 

vf/kfu;e esa ,d vkSj la’kks/ku djokrs gq, le; lhek dks **nks o"kZ** ls **rhu o"kZ**] vf/klwpuk fnukad 19-04-2018 

}kjk c<+k;k x;kA mDr la’kks/ku ds vuqlkj vf/kfu;e fnukad 20-04-2019 rd oS/k gSA 

d-  blds ckn uxj fuxe] xq:xzke vkSj Qjhnkckn dh 17 dkWyksfu;ksa] vU; uxj fuxeksa dh 343 dkWyksfu;ksa] 

uxjifj"knksa dh 106 dkWyksfu;ksa vkSj uxjikfydkvksa dh 181 dkWyksfu;ksa dks vkt rd vf/klwfpr fd;k x;k 

gSA 

[k-  fnukad 27-09-2018 dks fodkl 'kqYd tkjh fd;s x;s gSaA 

4- mDr vf/kfu;e dh oS/krk dks pkj o"kksZa rd c<kus dk la’kks/ku 21-04+-2016 ls 20-04-2020 rd] foHkkx }kjk ljdkj 

dks izLrqr fd;k x;k vkSj mlh dks fo/kku lHkk }kjk vuqeksfnr Hkh fd;k x;k] ysfdu vKkr dkj.kksa ds dkj.k bls 

vf/klwfpr ugha fd;k tk ldkA 

5- 21-04-2019 ls 20-04-2020 dh vof/k ds nkSjku] foHkkx us 15 dkWyksfu;ksa dh vf/klwpuk,a fnukad 18-06-2019]  

10-09-2019] 17-01-2020 vf/klwfpr dh vkSj fofHkUu funsZ’kksa dks Hkh tkjh fd;kA pwafd] la’kks/ku dks vf/klwfpr ugha 

fd;k tk ldk gS] blfy, vf/kfu;e dh oS/krk dk foLrkj djuk vko’;d gSA 

6- blds vykok] orZeku esa yxHkx 15 dkWyksfu;ka gSa] ftuds fy, uxj ikfydkvksa ls la’kksf/kr izLrko izkIr gqvk gS] 

ftUgsa vHkh mDr vf/kfu;e ds rgr vf/klwfpr fd;k tkuk gS] ftlds fy, Hkh mDr vf/kfu;e dh oS/krk dks 

foLrkfjr djuk vko’;d gSA 

7- dkWyksfu;ksa dh ?kks"k.kk ls lEcfU/kr lHkh dkjZokbZ oS/krk vof/k ds vUnj iwjh dh tkuh gS] ysfdu ;g ns[krs gq, fd 

dqN dkWyksfu;ksa dks vHkh rd vf/klwfpr ugha fd;k x;k gS] ftUkesa vf/kfu;e esa fufnZ"V oS/k vof/k ls vf/kd le; 

yxsxk] blfy, izfØ;k dks iwjk djus ds fy, vf/kfu;e dh /kkjk 4 esa rfFkr le; vof/k dks c<+k;k tkuk gSA vr% 

;g izLrkfor gS fd bl vf/kfu;e ds vuqHkkx 4¼1½ rFkk 4¼2½ esa 'kCnksa **rhu lky**] dks 'kCnksa **ikp lky** ls cny 

fn;k tk;s rkfd ,sls ;ksX; {ks=ksa dks ukxfjd lq[k&lqfo/kkvksa rFkk volajpuk viw.kZ uxjifkydk {ks= ?kksf"kr djus ds 

fy;s nks lky miyC/k djok;k tk lds rFkk bu {ks=ksa esa ewyHkwr lqfo/kk;sa iznku dh tk ldsA 

 vfuYk fot] 

 ’kgjh LFkkuh; fudk; ea=h] gfj;k.kkA  

_________ 

p.Mhx<+ % vkjå dså ukany] 

fnukad 24 vxLr] 2020- lfpoA 

8876—H.V.S.—H.G.P. Pkl. 


